

Donegal Township Board of Supervisors
Special Meeting held on March 26, 2019
Meeting Minutes.....4:35pm

Tom brought meeting to order.....

Pledge of Allegiance

Public in Attendance: none

Public Comment: none

New Business: Tom opened all Road Material Stone Bids received....

Bids was opened from New Enterprise Stone & Lime Company

Hanson Aggregates

Bullskin Lime and Stone

Derry Stone & Lime Co.

Amerikohl Aggregates

(attached is the Bid Tally results)

Upon review of bids received if all paper work is in order the Awarding of stone bids will be done at the April 8, 2019 Regular Township Meeting at 5:00pm

Tom motion to give the Chestnut Ridge Volunteer Fire Company \$25,000.00 towards new Fire Truck, Henry seconded, all agreed.

Dan motion to put out bids for 20 Ton Trailer...Bids will be opened at the April 23rd Special Meeting at 4:35pm, Tom seconded, all agreed.

Dan motion to order pipe and catch basins for the Low Volume & Dirt & gravel Road projects for 2019...will get 3 phone quotes. Tom seconded, all agreed

Dan motion to go in with Mt. Pleasant Township in the purchase of 1,000 gallons of oil to be applied on Cummings Road. Mt. Pleasant will bid the oil and Donegal Township will purchase the 1,000 gallons only. Tom seconded, all agreed.

Dan motion to check on the AFLAC insurance and how long the coverage will apply yet for 2019 for township.....Tom seconded, all agreed.

No other business

Motion by Henry to adjourn, Dan seconded, all agreed

4:50pm

Bid Tally Sheet 2019
STONE MATERIAL

Bid opening March 26, 2019 Special Mtg 4:35pm
Donegal Township Board of Supervisors

	#2RC	PICK UP	DELIVER	as/directed
New Ent		\$10.80	\$14.50	
Hanson		10.00	14.54	
Bullskin Stone		11.05	15.80	
Amerikohl		no bid	13.64	
Ligonier st		no bid	no bid	

	#2A	PICK UP	DELIVER
		\$10.75	\$14.45
		10.00	14.54
		11.05	15.80
		no bid	13.64
		no bid	no bid

	#R4	PICK UP	DELIVER
New Ent		\$18.90	\$23.60
Hanson		14.00	19.79
Bullskin Stone		13.60	18.85
Amerikohl		no bid	18.10
Ligonier st		13.36	23.13

	#57	PICK UP	DELIVER
		\$15.40	\$19.10
		12.50	17.29
		12.40	17.15
		no bid	15.64
		no bid	no bid

	#67	PICK UP	DELIVER
New Ent		\$15.40	\$19.10
Hanson		13.00	18.29
Bullskin stone		13.05	17.80
Amerikohl		no bid	15.64
Ligonier st		no bid	no bid

	#10	PICK UP	DELIVER
		\$11.75	\$15.45
		9.00	14.29
		no bid	no bid
		no bid	11.64
		no bid	no bid

	#3	PICK UP	DELIVER
New Ent		\$15.40	\$19.10
Hanson		12.50	17.79
Bullskin Stone		12.60	17.35
Amerikohl		no bid	15.64
Ligonier st		no bid	no bid

	#8	PICK UP	DELIVER
		\$20.00	\$23.70
		19.50	24.29
		no bid	no bid
		no bid	22.64
		no bid	no bid

	Anti-Skid	Pick-up	Deliver
New Ent		no bid	no bid
Hanson		no bid	no bid
Bullskin		no bid	no bid
Amerikohl		no bid	no bid
Ligonier St		16.30	25.50

Motion by _____

To award Stone Bids as Stated:

Pick-up Stone Bid Awarded to:

Delivered Stone Bid Awarded to:

	DSA	PICK UP	DELIVER
New Ent			
Hanson		did not bid out this year	
Derry Stone			
Amerikohl			

Seconded by _____

All in Favor _____